Invitation to Bid
Friday, June 13,2014 ~ 2:00PM

Bulk Chemical Bid
Company Name Bid Rcvd. Alum Caustic Fluoride Chlorine Carbon Dry Lime KMno4 | Phosphate
Suffolk Sales & Service Corp. |06-11-14 @ 12:04PM $163.30/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
Suffolk Solutions 06-11-14 @ 12:04PM No Bid $141.13/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
GEO Speciality Chemicals 06-11-14 @ 12:04PM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
.59/1b or
Dominion Chemical Company [06-11-14 @ 10:07AM No Bid No Bid $1,180/WT No Bid No Bid $8.83/Bag No Bid No Bid
*X20 Inc. 06-12-14 @ 10:30AM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.37/g
Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC 06-12-14 @ 12:48PM $189.15/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
$20,947.50
Carus Corporation 06-12-14 @ 12:48PM No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid | or $5.985/g
Waterguard Inc. 06-13-14 @ 9:43AM No Bid $152/WT No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
* Brenntag 06-13-14 @ 11:30AM No Bid No Bid $650/WT $2.45/g $1,340/T $304/T $4.04/1b $5.13/g
Univar 06-13-14 @ 1:40 PM $172.20/WT $133.80/WT | $756.00/WT $0.72/g $1,300/DT | $298.00/DT $3.31 No Bid

* Did not provide product specs
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