
 

City of Emporia 
Bid Tabulation 

Page 1 of 2 

 

 
Service:  Bulk Chemical  
WTP and WWTP 

Bid Opening:  6.24.2021 @ 2PM 
 
Opened By: Lori Jarratt  

 
Witness: Mike Allen         
 

 
 

Suffolk Sales & Service Corp.  
 Rcvd: 6-30-20/11:32AM 

 
 

 
 
CONTACT: Jessica Quearry 
PHONE: 757.238.8740 
EMAIL:quearryj@suffolksales.com 
 

  

Chemtrade Chemicals 
Rcvd: 6.23.2021/12:35PM  

 
 
 

 
CONTACT:  Elizabeth Ryno 
PHONE: 800-441-2659 
EMAIL:bids@chemtradelogistics.com  
 

 

     Water Guard, Inc 
Rcvd: 6.23.2021/1:54PM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT:  James Moyer 
PHONE: 252-237-5205 
EMAIL: jim@waterguardinc.com 
 

 
 

 

Univar  
Rcvd: 6.22.2021/12:25PM 

 
 

 
 
CONTACT:  Michael Crea 
PHONE:  215-337-5411  
EMAIL: michael.crea@univarsolutions.com   
  
 

 

C&S Chemicals 
 Rcvd: 6.22.2021/12:25PM 

 
 
 
 

CONTACT: Mike Chandles 
PHONE: 770-977-2669 
EMAIL: sales@candschemicals.com 

 

Shannon Chemical Corp. 
 Rcvd: 6.17.2021/1:04PM 

 
 
 

CONTACT: Daniel C. Flynn  
PHONE:  610-363-9090 
EMAIL: dcflynn@channonchem.com  
 

Product Price Price Price Price Price  

Alum Liquid (200 WT) $149.59/WT  
$183.82/WT  
(or $379/DT) 

No Bid $178.12/WT $210/WT No Bid 

Caustic Liquid (325WT) No Bid No Bid $168.50/WT $172.50/WT No Bid No Bid 

Fluoride (6.0 WT) No Bid No Bid No Bid $518/WT No Bid No Bid 

Chlorine Bleach (13,000G) $0.82/G No Bid $0.78/G $0.92/G No Bid No Bid 

Carbon (8 DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,691/T No Bid No Bid 

Dry Lime (26 DT) No Bid No Bid No Bid $529.00/T No Bid No Bid 

Potassium Permanganate (CAIROX) 
4,000LBS/55lb. pails 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.65/lb. No Bid $1.92/LB. 

Phosphate (3,000G /300 G. Totes) No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $7.83/G 

Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums) 

Citric Acid 50% Tech Grade (30) No Bid No Bid No Bid $10.07/G No Bid 
$960.85/55G Drum 

$17.47/G 

Sodium Bisulfite 40% Tech Grade 
(3) 

No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2188/lb. No Bid No Bid 

Sulfuric Acid 50% Tech Grade (3) No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.3028/lb. No Bid No Bid 

Caustic 50% NSF 60 (6) No Bid No Bid No Bid $0.2489/lb. No Bid No Bid 

Chlorine Bleach 16% NSF 60 (5) No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.0377/G No Bid No Bid 
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Service:  Bulk Chemical  
WTP and WWTP 

Bid Opening:  6.24.2021 @ 2PM 
 
Opened By: Lori Jarratt  

 
Witness: Mike Allen         
 

 
 

USALCO 
Rcvd: 6.25.2021/10:15AM 

 
Bid was received late 

 

Brenntag 
Rcvd: 6.22.2021/12:25PM 

 
 
 
CONTACT: Stephanie Ubach  
PHONE:  434-942-4723 

EMAIL:subach@brenntag.co
m   

Chemrite 
Rcvd: 6.23.2021/12:35PM 

 
 
 
 
CONTACT: Aaron Opp  
PHONE:  770.271.5576 
EMAIL: orders@chemrite.com  

Product Price Price Price 

Alum Liquid (200 WT) 
Bid was received late-Not Accepted 

 No Bid 
No Bid 

Caustic Liquid (325WT)  $158.60 (Min. 22WT) 
No Bid  

Fluoride (6.0 WT)  $520/WT 
No Bid 

Chlorine Bleach (13,000G)  No Bid No Bid 

Carbon (8 DT)  $1,450/DT $1,860/WT 

Dry Lime (26 DT)  No Bid No Bid 

Potassium Permanganate (CAIROX) 
4,000LBS/55lb. pails 

 $2.10/lb.  
$1.98/lb. 

K-Ox or Universal 

Phosphate (3,000G /300 G. Totes)  No Bid 
$6.98/G 

LOP-1900 

Membrane Facility (55 Gallon Drums) 

Citric Acid 50% Tech Grade (30)  No Bid No Bid 

Sodium Bisulfite 40% Tech Grade (3)  No Bid No Bid 

Sulfuric Acid 50% Tech Grade (3)  No Bid No Bid 

Caustic 50% NSF 60 (6)  No Bid No Bid 

Chlorine Bleach 16% NSF 60 (5)  No Bid No Bid 
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